
Witness to War: The Divisions of the Army of
the 1943-1945
The United States Army underwent a massive expansion during World War
II, growing from a force of just over 200,000 men in 1941 to over 8 million
men by the end of the war. This expansion was accompanied by a
corresponding increase in the number of divisions, from 27 in 1941 to over
90 by the end of the war.
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The divisions of the Army were organized into various types, including
infantry, armored, airborne, and cavalry divisions. Each type of division had
its own unique mission and capabilities. Infantry divisions were the
backbone of the Army, providing the bulk of the ground forces. Armored
divisions were equipped with tanks and other armored vehicles, and were
used to spearhead attacks and break through enemy lines. Airborne
divisions were trained to parachute into combat, and were used to seize
objectives behind enemy lines. Cavalry divisions were mounted on
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horseback or in jeeps, and were used for reconnaissance and raiding
missions.

The divisions of the Army fought in all of the major campaigns of World War
II, from the beaches of Normandy to the jungles of the Pacific. They played
a vital role in the Allied victory, and their legacy continues to this day.

The Infantry Division

The infantry division was the most common type of division in the Army
during World War II. It was designed to fight on foot, and was equipped with
a variety of weapons, including rifles, machine guns, mortars, and artillery.
Infantry divisions were also supported by tanks and other armored vehicles.

The infantry division was a versatile unit that could be used in a variety of
roles, including进攻,防御,and reconnaissance. Infantry divisions were also
used to garrison occupied territories and to provide security for other units.

The infantry division was a tough and resilient unit that could withstand
heavy casualties. Infantrymen were known for their courage and
determination, and they played a vital role in the Allied victory.

The Armored Division

The armored division was a powerful and mobile unit that was designed to
spearhead attacks and break through enemy lines. It was equipped with a
variety of tanks and other armored vehicles, as well as infantry and artillery.
Armored divisions were also supported by aircraft and other air support.

The armored division was a devastating force on the battlefield. Its tanks
could crush enemy positions, and its infantry could clear out enemy



bunkers and trenches. Armored divisions were also very mobile, and they
could quickly exploit breakthroughs in the enemy lines.

The armored division was a key element in the Allied victory in World War
II. It played a major role in the breakout from Normandy, the liberation of
France, and the defeat of Germany.

The Airborne Division

The airborne division was a specialized unit that was trained to parachute
into combat. It was equipped with light weapons and equipment, and was
supported by aircraft and other air support. Airborne divisions were used to
seize objectives behind enemy lines, such as airfields, bridges, and
crossroads.

The airborne division was a very risky unit to use, but it could also be very
effective. Airborne divisions were able to surprise the enemy and seize key
objectives that would have been difficult to capture by other means.
Airborne divisions also played a key role in the liberation of Europe, and
they helped to pave the way for the Allied victory.

The Cavalry Division

The cavalry division was a mounted unit that was used for reconnaissance
and raiding missions. It was equipped with horses, jeeps, and other
vehicles, and was armed with rifles, machine guns, and mortars. Cavalry
divisions were also supported by artillery and aircraft.

The cavalry division was a versatile unit that could be used in a variety of
roles. It was used to scout ahead of the main force, to raid enemy



positions, and to protect flanks. Cavalry divisions also played a key role in
the pursuit of the enemy after major battles.

The cavalry division was a fading force by World War II, but it still played a
valuable role in the Allied victory. Cavalry divisions were used to great
effect in the North African campaign, and they helped to pave the way for
the Allied invasion of Italy.

The divisions of the Army of the 1943-1945 were a diverse and capable
force that played a vital role in the Allied victory in World War II. These
divisions fought in all of the major campaigns of the war, and their legacy
continues to this day.

The divisions of the Army are a source of great pride for the United States.
They represent the best of what our nation has to offer, and they will
continue to serve our country with distinction for many years to come.
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